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Perhaps as a result of my background in the Continental legal tradition, for a long 
time I avoided writing about free will and in this respect shared the attitude of many 
German legal scholars. In the discourse that I was most familiar with, there seemed 
to be two groups of opinions separated by an impenetrable wall, the practically 
thinking die-hards who always presuppose free will no matter how strong the evi-
dence is against them and the allegedly more enlightened thinkers who reject free 
will on account of the psychological evidence or at least allow for the possibility that 
there is no free will. If members of the two groups meet, their discussion typically 
takes the following form: Those who call free will into doubt focus on statements of 
psychologists and results of brain-imaging studies which support their opinion, while 
their opponents question the reliability of the studies and point to the devastating 
practical effect of abandoning the presumption of free will. Such discussions are 
notorious for never leading to a conclusion.

Nevertheless, the idea to organize a workshop on free will emerged as I listened 
to Professor Ronald Allen’s presentation of a paper at Northwestern University 
School of Law on the occasion of the 100th anniversary of the Northwestern Law 
Review.1 Discussing the notion of free will in the context of Miranda rights, he pre-
sented an argument that free will is not only a concept to be avoided because of 
insufficient scientific evidence in favour of its support, but that we actually have no 
clear idea what we are talking about when using the term – that free will is an inco-
herent notion. Professor Allen is not alone with this opinion. Renowned philoso-
phers like Galen Strawson2 have developed a similar argument and his arguments 
have been favourably received by other philosophers including Saul Smilansky.3

Professor Allen’s remarks completely altered my view of the free will problem 
because here at last was a question that could and should be answered, namely 
whether the term free will can be explicated in a coherent manner. Incoherent terms 
should not be tolerated in law, much less serve as an important criterion in making 
legal decisions because there is always the possibility that the public will one day 
discover this incoherence, and that will substantially undermine trust in the legal 
system. Further, the problem of incoherence is not much discussed by legal scholars. 
I am not aware of any Continental works on this topic and therefore I feel that here 
is a substantial amount of work to do in this area. At the same time, examining the 
coherence of the term would bring in much of the complicated debate related to the 
classical problem of whether it is reasonable to accept free will given the empirical 
evidence at our disposal. It would not be sufficient to prove that there is a coherent 
shallow notion of free will which would be totally irrelevant for the law. Rather, it is 
vital to examine whether a coherent notion can be found which is deep enough to 
meet the needs of the legal system. If this is not possible, we have to look for a sub-
stitute, which in turn could require structural alterations to the legal system.
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Thus the same options have to be taken into consideration as when discussing 
the classical problem of whether free will should be accepted given the empirical 
evidence at our disposal. We can accept the possibility of a classical libertarian vari-
ant of free will, we can reject such a notion as unattainable because of its incoher-
ence and rest content with a more shallow notion which is compatible with deter-
minism (compatibilism), or we can reject free will altogether and accept a hard de-
terminist view. A fruitless empirical discussion in this way could be turned into a 
fruitful conceptual discussion.

After I had talked over the matter with Professor Allen, he encouraged me to 
organize a workshop on the conceptual problem of free will at the IVR World Con-
gress in Kraków in 2007. I felt it would be good to let a historian participate in the 
discussion because he could enlighten us on how free will was used at crucial points 
in history, but I wondered where I could find the right person. When I visited Pro-
fessor John Warwick Montgomery in Strasbourg, it occurred to me that what was 
actually needed for such a debate was a theologian rather than a historian because 
the free will problem received its most intense discussion during the Period of the 
Reformation. Professor Montgomery is not only a professor of law but also a well-
known theologian – a rare combination. I need only add that after I had talked to 
him about the incoherence question and he, independently from Professor Allen, 
suggested that we should have a workshop on the topic, I proceeded to put my plan 
into practice.

We were fortunate to be joined by Justice David Hodgson from the Supreme 
Court of New South Wales who in a book4 and numerous distinctive articles (among 
them a contribution to the Oxford Handbook of Free Will)5 has become a promi-
nent contributor to the free will debate by developing a libertarian view of free will 
which he also defends in the present volume. We further received two interesting 
contributions by representatives of the younger generation, Allan McCay from Syd-
ney University who is writing his Ph.D. thesis on the subject and Juan Pablo Mañalich 
from the University of Santiago de Chile who is staying at Bonn University as a 
Humboldt grantee at the moment. McCay explored a crucial point made by Saul 
Smilansky, luck’s undermining effect on moral responsibility which becomes rele-
vant when considering the views of those who see free will as compatible with deter-
minism. Mañalich undertook to show that a compatibilist background is sufficient 
as a basis of modern criminal responsibility.

My impression is that the diversity of standpoints among the participants of our 
workshop ensured lively presentations of the problem so that no important aspect 
of the conceptual discussion has been left out.
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